
In the Commission's reconsideration of its 
previous decision in this case, it concluded 
that it reached the right result, even though 
the mode of analysis was wrong. It con­
cluded that the taxpayer established the ele­
ments of manufacturing and held that the 
taxpayer is a manufacturer. It also concluded 
that in the taxpayer's operation, the materials 
processed by the taxpayer have no actual 
marlcet value as bumpers, before processing, 
and consequently the taxpayer's operations 
cannot be deemed to be repairs. 

The department has not appealed this deci­
sion. 

D 

Allocation of income--separate account­
ing.Nelson Brothers Furniture Corpora/ion 
vs. W,sconsinDepartment oJRevenue (Court 
of Appeals, District IV, October 26, 1989). 
This is an appeal from a judgment affirming 
a decision of the Wisconsin Tax Appeals 
Commission, which upheld a determination 
of the Department of Revenue that Nelson 
Brothers, an Illinois corporation carrying on 
a portion of its business in WISConsin, had 
underpaid Wisconsin franchise taxes in the 
years 1974 through 1978. The issues in this 
case are: 

(A) The appropriate scope of the Court of 
Appeals' review of the Commission's deci­
sion where its inquiry was limited to whether 
the department abused its discretion in carry­
ing out a specific statulOry duty. 

(B) Whether the department abused its dis­
cretionindirectingachangeinthetaxpayer's 
accounting methods which led to increased 
Wisconsin franchise tax liability. 

(C) Whether the change violated the 
taxpayer's right to due process of law. 

The department cross-appeals from that 
portion of the judgmentrernanding the matter 
to the Commission with directions to consider 
the taxpayer's argument that, should the as­
sessment stand, it is entitled to an "equitable 
recoupment" in the form of an adjustment to 
the apportionment formula 
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The Department of Revenue, after an audit, 
determined that because Nelson Brothers' 
Wisconsin operations were an integral part 
of a "unitary" business, the separate account­
ing method failed to properly reflect taxable 
income for the years in question. The de­
partmentrecomputed the company's income 
using a different method - the "apportion­
ment" or "formula" method- and ordered 
Nelson Brothers to use the apportionment 
method to calculate its Wisconsin income in 
the future. 

Nelson Brothers also raised an "alternative" 
argument before the Commission, contend­
ing that, should the assessment be affrrmed, 
the company should beallowedan "equitable 
recoupment" - an offset against the newly­
assessed liability representing an adjustment 
to the "sales factor" of the apportionment 
equation to reflect intangible income. The 
neteffectof theadjustment would be to lower 
the tax due. Because Nelson Brothers had not 
raised the recoupment issue before the de­
partment, but argued it for the first time in its 
brief to the Commission, the Commission 
held that it lacked jurisdiction to consider it 

The Court concluded that 

(A) The scope of its review is to look to the 
facts found by the Commission, and the 
evidentiary basis for such fmdings; and then 
to consider whether, on those facts, the de­
partment exercised its discretion in a rea­
sonable, nonarbitrary manner. The Court 
owes no deference to the Commission's 
conclusions. 

(B) The record satisfies the Court that the 
decision to require the change in Nelson 
Brothers' accounting methods was neither 
unconsidered nor irrational. It was a rea­
soned and reasonable decision and thus a 
proper exercise of discretion. Therefore, in 
light of the directions in sec. 71.07(2), Wis. 
Stats. (1985-86), the department reasonably 
and properly exercised its discretion to direct 
the change in Nelson Brothers' accounting 
practices. 

(C) The fact that application of the appor­
tionment formula results in an increase of 
Wisconsin-allocated income-according to 
the department, an average 13.68 percent 
increase over the five-year audit period -
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and thus an increase in the company's Wis­
consin tax liability has been upheld over 
similar objections in Container Corp. vs. 
FranchiseTaxBd.,463 U.S.159, 170(1983) 
and Underwood Typewriter Co. vs. Cham­
berlain, 254 U.S. 113 (1920). The Court was 
not persuaded that the increase in Nelson 
Brothers' tax liability renders the 
department's action unconstitutional. 

In the matter of the department's cross-ap­
peal, the court concluded that the statutory 
procedures for appealing department deci­
sionsdonot specify thecontentsoftheappeal 
documents, and nothing in the statutes sug­
gests thatthereviewmust bestrictly confined 
to the claims raised before the department In 
addition, the Court was not convinced that 
Nelson Brothers' recoupment claim is a 
"grievance [] to the assessment," within the 
meaning of sec. Tax 3.91(1), Wis. Adm. 
Code. It is an equitable claim for an offset to 
the reassessment which is not barred from 
the Commission's consideration by the 
taxpayer'sfailuretoargueittothedepartment. 

The taxpayer and the department have not 
appealed this decision. 

D 

Allocation of income-between affiliates. 
Wisconsin Department of Revenue vs. Sentry 
Financial Services Corpora/ion, and Sentry 
Financial Services Corpora/ion vs. Wis­
consinDepartmentofRevenue(CircuitCourt 
of Portage County, February 20, 1990). This 
decision arises from petitions by both parties 
to review a decision of the WISConsin Tax 
Appeals Commission. The petitions for re­
view involve two issues: 

(A) WhethertheCommission'sfindingthat 
a bargain sale occurred was supported by 
substantial evidence in the record. 

(B) Whether the department abused its dis­
cretion when it reallocated income to Sentry 
Financial Services Corporation (SENCO) 
pursuant to sec. 71.11(7m), Wis. Stats. (1981-
82). 

This case arises out of a transaction between 
SENCO, a wholly owned subsidiary of the 
Sentry Corporation (SENCOR), and 
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SENCOR, which itself is a wholly owned 
subsidiary of Sentry Insurance, a Mutual 
Company (SIAMCO). In 1972, SENCO 
purchasedanaircraftfor$4,623,560.85, with 
the intention to lease it to SIAMCO. On 
September I, 1973, SENCO as lessor, and 
SIAMCO as lessee, entered into a written 
lease for the aircraft The lease term was for 
10 years, including a period of use beginning 
January I, 1973. The lease expired on De­
cember 31, 1982. During the term of the 
lease, SENCO included in its income a total 
amount of $6,355,560.85, pursuant to the 
lease. Records and testimony of SENCO 
employes indicated an intention to sell the 
aircraft to SIAMCO at the expiration of the 
lease, for I 0% of its original purchase price. 
The right to purchase was not contained in 
the lease document 

On December 31, 1982, the lease ended. On 
that date, SENCO transferred the aircraft to 
SENCOR and received in return from 
SENCORapaymentof$453,560.85,or 10% 
of the original purchase price of the aircraft. 
The transfer was made to SENCOR, 
SIAMCO's subsidiary, rather than to 
SIAM CO itself due to a corporate decision to 
house all aircraft owned by the Sentry group 
of companies in SENCOR. The sale price 
was included in SENCO's income for 1982. 
SENCOpaidsales tax on the sale. The sale of 
the aircraft by SENCO to SENCOR was not 
done pursuant to a plan of tax avoidance, and 
the department stipulated that it did not base 
its assessment on the grounds that an ad­
justment was necessary in order to prevent 
evasion of taxes within the meaning of sec. 
71.l 1(7m), Wis. Stats. After the December 
31 transfer, the aircraft continued in use by 
corporations within the Sentry group. For 
that use, SENCOR received fees and reim­
bursements. In June 1986, SENCOR sold the 
aircraft to an unrelated third-party for ap­
proximately $4,600,000.00. 

The department assessed SENCO for addi­
tional income taxes for 1982, based upon the 
allocation of a taxable gain for the sale of the 
aircraft to SENCOR. The assessment was 
determined by adding the fair market value 
of the aircraft less its adjusted basis, to 
SEN CO 's taxable income. The Commission 
found that the sale of the aircraft by SEN CO 
to SENCOR was a "bargain sale", and was 
not made pursuant to an arms length right to 
purchase under the lease. The Commission 
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also held: I) that the department failed to 
properly consider the substantive provision 
of secs. 71.301 and 71.311, Wis. Stats., which 
govern the tax consequences of a "subsidiary 
to parent" bargain sale, 2) that the sale of 
assets by a corporation to its shareholders for 
less than fair market value is treated as a 
distribution under !RC sec. 301 (sec. 71.301, 
Wis. Stats.), and 3) that therefore, by reallo­
cating income under sec. 71.11(7m), Wis. 
Stats., despite the tax-free provisions of secs. 
71.301 and 71.311, Wis. Stats., the depart­
mentabuseditsdiscretion,applyingthe wrong 
legal standard to the facts. 

The Circuit Court concluded that the Com­
mission clearly had substantial evidence in 
the record to support its decision that the 
transfer of the aircraft from SENCO to 
SENCOR was a "bargain sale". The Court 
also concluded that the original plan to lease 
with the option to purchase and the resulting 
tax consequences to SEN CO did not require 
a reallocation of income to correctly reflect 
its income upon a transfer of the aircraft 
betweenrelatedcompanies,andthusdeclined 
to reverse the Commission 'sdecision that the 
department abused its discretion in reallo­
cating the income. 

The department has appealed this decision to 
the Court of Appeals. 

□ 

SALES/USE TAXES 

Waste reduction and recycling. Parks­
Pioneer Corporation vs. Wisconsin Depart­
ment of Revenue (Wisconsin Tax Appeals 
Commission, March 23, 1990). The issue is 
whether the purchases and sales described 
below were exempt under sec. 77.54(26m), 
Wis. Stats., which exempts from sales and 
use tax the gross receipts from the sale of or 
use or other consumption of waste reduction 
or recycling machinery and equipmen~ in­
cludingpartstherefor,exclusivelyanddirectly 
usedforwastereductionorrecyclingactivities 
which reduce the amount of solid waste 
generated or recycle solid waste. The ex­
emptionapplieseven though an economically 
useful end product results from the use of the 
machinery and equipment 

During the period under review, the taxpayer 
was a corporation registered to operate a 
business in Wisconsin and engaged in recy­
cling solid waste, including scrap metal. The 
taxpayer's business operation includes all 
functions which directly relate to the pre­
paring, sorting, weighing, and processing 
scrap metal into prepared grades of metal so 
as to be used by industries such as smelting, 
foundries, and steel mills. These functions 
commenced with the initial collection of 
scrap metal and ended with sale and delivery 
of the prepared grades of metal to its cus­
tomers. 

The taxpayer purchased scrap metal from 
various suppliers. In most instances, the 
taxpayer picked up and transported to its 
place of business the scrap metal from vari­
ouscollectionsiteson thesuppliers' premises. 
The suppliers would fill the taxpayer's lug­
gerandroll-offboxes with scrap metal. When 
full, the taxpayer picked them up and left 
replacement boxes. 

The following items were purchased for the 
taxpayer's operations without payment of 
sales/use tax: 

(A) Luggerboxesandroll-offboxes used to 
collect and transport scrap metal to the pre­
mises and recycled metal to the taxpayer's 
customers. 

(B) Tarpsandbandsusedtocoverthelugger 
boxes when scrap metal was in transit 

(C) Starting fluid used to start diesel engines 
in cold weather on cranes used in the recy­
cling yard to move heavy pieces of scrap 
metal. 

(D) Truck scales, including repairs and re­
placement parts, used to weigh the scrap 
metal on the taxpayer's premises. 

(E) Platform scales used to weigh scrap metal 
to assist in pricing of recycled metal held for 
sale. 

(F) A dead lift roll-off hoist mounted on one 
of the taxpayer's trucks and used at the 
collection points of scrap metal. 

(G) Replacement hydraulic hose for trucks 
used to collect and transport scrap metal. 



The lugger and roll-off boxes were equiJ>­
ment used by the taxpayer for the sole pur­
pose of collecting and transporting of scrap 
metal to the taxpayer's place of business and 
delivering recycled metal to cuslOmers. Use 
in customer delivery did not exceed 10% of 
the time used. Tarps and bands were equiJ>­
ment used solely to cover the boxes to pre­
vent material from falling out in transit. The 
scales in question were equipment used solely 
in weighing the unprepared and prepared 
scrap metal to determine purchase or sale 
price. Weight and grade of metal combined is 
the industry's method of pricing scrap metal. 
The dead lift roll-off hoist was mounted on a 
truck and used only to lift lugger and roll-off 
boxes on to and off trucks for movement and 
scales in order to weigh and price the scrap 
metal. The hydraulic hoses were used as 
replacement parts in the taxpayer's trucks 
used in metal transportation. Although aJ>­
propriated on the taxpayer's books to trucks, 
the starting fluid in question was used in cold 
weather to start diesel engines on cranes used 
on the taxpayer's premises solely to move 
heavy pieces of scrap metal. The fluid is 
sprayed into the engine, clearing moisture 
and enabling starting. 

The taxpayer sold a load lugger box in Oc­
tober 1984 to Johnson Metal of Racine. The 
taxpayercollectednosales tax, believing that 
the sale would be exempt under the recycling 
exemption in question. The use of the 
equipment by the purchaser, however, was 
not established. The taxpayer sold 3 self­
dumping hoppers to A.E.F. Salvage, a small, 
one-man trucking operation. The testimony 
ofthetaxpayer'switnessconcemingpossible 
resale by A.E.F. wassomewhatcontradictory 
and was insufficient to establish that or any 
other exemption to the sales tax requirement. 

The Department of Revenue's assessment 
included sales or use tax on the items dis­
cussed previously. 

The Commission concluded that items pur­
chased by the taxpayer were "recycling ma­
chinery and equipment, including parts 
therefor, exclusively and directly used for ... 
or recycling activities which reduce the 
amount of solid wasu, generated [or] ... recycle 
solid wasu,," within the meaning of sec. 
77.54(26m), Wis. Stats. The Commission 
also held that the burden of proving that a sale 
of tangible personal property is not a taxable 
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sale at retail is upon the seller unless acer­
tificau, of resale or exemption described in 
sec. 77.52(14), Wis. Stats., is taken from the 
purchaser. The taxpayer's sales were not 
supportedbyaresaleorexemptioncertificau, 
produced by the purchasers and were not 
otherwise shown to be exempt from tax. 

This decision has been appealed to the Cir­
cuit Court. 

0 

When and where sale takes place. Repub­
lic Airlines.Inc. vs Wisconsin Department of 
Revenue (Circuit Court of Dane County, 
February 12, 1990). This is a petition for 
judicial review of a decision of the Wisconsin 
Tax Appeals Commission which affmned 
the WISConsin Department of Revenue's as­
sessment against Republic Airlines, Inc. 
(Republic) for the sales and use tax in 1981-
1984 on liquor and soda pop served to pas­
sengersduringflightsin Wisconsin's airspace. 
The decision also denied the department's 
assessment of a use tax on complimentary 
peanuts that Republic gave to passengers. 
See Wisconsin TaxBuJ/etin6l,page 11, fora 
review of this case. 

Republic Airlines, Inc., now Northwest Air­
lines, Inc., was a Wisconsin corporation en­
gaged in the business of interstalll commer­
cial air transportation in Wisconsin and 
elsewhere, with principal offices in Minnea­
polis,Minnesota.Republicmaintainedoffices 
in Wisconsin, had equipment and personnel 
located at airports in Wisconsin, and flew 
regularly-scheduled flights into, between, 
and out of a number of Wisconsin cities. 
Some of Republic's flights used Wisconsin 
airspace but never touched down. The latter 
are referred to as uoverflights". 

Republic sold liquor on its flights and gave 
out complimentary soda pop, peanuts, and 
sometimes also liquor to its passengers. Re­
public did not keep records of the location of 
its aircraft during the above transactions, i.e., 
whethertheaircraftwasin Wisconsin airspace 
or in another stare's airspace. 

To apportion WISCOnsinsales tax to Republic's 
gros.sreceipts for liquor sales, and Wisconsin 
use tax to Republic's purchases of compli-
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mentary irems, Republic applied a ratio of 
revenue passenger miles (RPMs) flown in 
WISConsin (the numerator) to RPMs flown 
everywhere (the denominator). The ratio's 
numera10r included flights which either de­
parted from or landed in Wisconsin but did 
not include overflights. The department ad­
justed the numerator to include RPMs for 
overflights. 

The taxpayer contended that: 

(A) The Commission was erroneous in its 
findings that sales occurring over Wisconsin 
are sales "in this stare" as that phrase is used 
in sec. 77.52(1), Wis. Stats., and that the use 
or consumption of complimentary soda pop, 
peanuts, and liquor used or consumed on 
overflights are used and consumed "in this 
stall:" as that phrase is used in sec. 77.53(1), 
Wis. Stats. The taxpayer conll:nded that the 
language "in this stall:" in secs. 77.52(1) and 
77.53(1) does not mean "over this stall:". 

(B) The application of Wisconsin's sales 
and use tax to overflights violates the Com­
merce Clause and Due Process Clause of the 
United States Constitution. 

(C) The taxes at is.sue lack inu,mal consis­
tency because of the potential for cumulative 
burdens posed by multiple taxation. 

(D) The final prong of Complete Auto is not 
satisfied because the taxation of overflights 
is not fairly relallld to benefits provided by 
the Stall:. 

Regarding the department's use tax assess­
ment on complimentary peanuts and other 
snacks served by Republic, the Commission 
found that these irems are exempt from use 
tax under sec. 77.54(20), Wis. Stats. The 
department argued that the Commission was 
without jurisdiction to raise sec. 77.54(20), 
WIS. Stats., because Republic did not affir­
matively assert the exemption as a defense. 

The Circuit Court concluded that: 

(A) The phrase "in this stall:" in those sec­
tions is unambiguous, and that it does mean 
"over this state." 

(B) The mere fact that the taxpayer's air­
planes fly over Wisconsin does not suffice to 
meet the substantial nexus test, but that the 
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substantial nexus test is satisfied by the fact 
that the taxpayer maintains offices, equip­
ment, and personnel in Wisconsin and is 
incorporated in Wisconsin. 

(C) The mere possibility of multiple taxa­
tion is insufficient to invalidate the tax. 

(D) The United States Supreme Court has 
held that the ''fairly related" prong is satisfied 
literally bythestateproviding"theadvantages 
ofa civilized society." Exxon Corp. vs. Wis­
consinDepartmenl of Revenue, 44 7 U.S. 207, 
228 (1980). Wisconsin has indeed provided 
Republic with such advantages, for example, 
the protection of Wisconsin's laws, opportu­
nities for further commerce, the availability 
of fire and other emergency services, and 
ground preparation for emergency landings. 

Pursuant ID sec. 227.57(9), WIS. Stats., the 
Court also concluded that the complimen­
tary snacks and peanuts provided by Repub­
lic are exempt from Wisconsin use tax under 
sec. 77.54(20), Wis. Stats. 

TAX RELEASES 
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The taxpayer and the department have ap­
pealed this decision ID the Court of Appeals. 

□ 

Boats, vessels and barges---,storage out­
side Wisconsin. Leonard W. Vanasse vs. 
Wisconsin Department of Revenue (Wis­
consin Tax Appeals Commission, February 
19, 1990). The issue in this case is whether 
the Department of Revenue correctly as­
sessed a use tax against the taxpayer on the 
purchase of the boat in question, pursuant ID 
sec. 77 .53, Wis. Stats. 

The taxpayer, a resident of Hudson, Wiscon­
sin, entered inlD a purchase agreement re­
garding a 44 foot Trojan boat from a Min­
nesota resident The closing on the sale oc­
curred in August 1981, and the boat was 
delivered by a marina service ID the taxpayer 
at a marina near Hudson, Wisconsin. No 
sales tax was paid ID the state of Minnesota. 
On the first trip out with the boat, about 75 

feet from the dock, the prop and other com­
ponent parts were damaged by rocks. This 
necessitated IDwing the boat ID the Hudson 
marina. The boat remained there for a few 
weeks while arrangements were made ID 
take it ID Stillwater, Minnesota for repairs. It 
was moved ID Stillwater and remained there 
for the winter. The next season, in 1982, the 
boat was kept at dock in Stillwater, taken out 
once, and the taxpayer decided ID sell the 
boat Harris Yacht Sales of Prescott, Wis­
consin handled the sale in July 1982. The 
boat, because of its type, was documented 
with the Coast Guard and not registered by 
the State of Wisconsin. 

The Commission concluded that the tax­
payer, a Wisconsin resident, did purchase the 
boat for use in Wisconsin, and that since the 
taxpayer did not pay a use tax on the boat, the 
department correctly assessed a use tax un­
der Wisconsin Statutes. 

The taxpayer has not appealed this decision. 

□ 

("Tax Releases" are designed to provide answers to the specific tax 
questions covered, based on the facts indicated. In situations where 
the facts vary from those given herein, the answers may not apply. 
Unless otherwise indicaled, Tax Releases apply for all periods open 
to adjustmenl. All references to section nwnhers are to the Wisconsin 
Statutes unless otherwise noted.) 

7. Penalties on Retirement Plans (p. 22) 
8. Wisconsin Income Tax Treatment of Passive Activity Losses 

(p. 23) 

Individual and Fiduciary Income Taxes 

I. Wisconsin Filing Requirements for Qualified Subchapter S 
Trusts (p. 26) 

The following Tax Releases are included: 

Individual Income Taxes 

I. A Shareholder's Share of a Tax-Option (S) Corporation's Farm 
Income for Estimated Tax Purposes (p. 13) 

2. Amortization of Bond Premium on State and Local Bonds 
(p. 13) 

3. Credit for Taxes Paid ID Other States on Tax-Option (S) Corpo-
ration and Partnership Income (p. 14) 

4. Disability Income Exclusion (p. 15) 
5. Exclusion of Capital Gains on Small Business Stock (p. 15) 
6. Gain or Loss on the Sale of a Partnership Interest by a Nonresi­

dent (p. 22) 

Corporation Franchise or Income Taxes 

I. Dividends Received Deduction - Requirement to Own Stock 
During Entire Taxable Year (p. 27) 

2. Due Dates and Estimated Tax Payment Requirements for Short­
Period Corporate Returns (p. 27) 

3. Recognition of Adjustments Necessary as a Result of a Change 
in Method of Accounting (p. 29) 

4. Return Requirements Under an "F' Reorganization (p. 29) 
5. Wisconsin Research Facilities Credit (p. 30) 
6. Wisconsin Tax Treatment of a Net Operating Loss Incurred in a 

Short Taxable Year Resulting From a Change in Accounting 
Period (p. 32) 
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